
Customer Name : Mayur Shilu
Shrimad Bhavan, Dhebar Road

Project Name: JBS Employee Tracking
Following are the details of working from 01/Jun/2021 to 30/Jun/2021.

  Day: 1     Date: 01/Jun/2021
  Work Description:
  Make Copy Of Agricon App publish BKPL team in Playstore  New Task Discussion  about  call pick and
cut  , Perform Call on Party Visit mobile number click  Detect Call Started And Call Ended R&D  Not able
to get Outgoing call answered   
  Day: 2     Date: 02/Jun/2021
  Work Description:
  out going call acceped R&D not able to find doc it's only allow system apps out going call answered  ,
REEMOVING UNNECESSARTY CODE IN VISIT SCREEN  BECAUSE SKIPPED ON PHON CALL 
API CALLING CHECKIN CHECKOUT  
  Day: 3     Date: 03/Jun/2021
  Work Description:
  code cleanup and R&D on calling outgoing ccept reject , bkpl issue in checkin checkout makee copy and
provided .apk 
  Day: 4     Date: 04/Jun/2021
  Work Description:
  Submit bkpl in play store  Code review , Code review bkpl app testing 
  Day: 5     Date: 05/Jun/2021
  Work Description:
  Task Discussio if any  calling code review in checkin check out screen , Reviewing issue in agricon while
placing order  Date selection issue 
  Day: 6     Date: 07/Jun/2021
  Work Description:
  As Discuss in call Trying to resolving issue & performance improvement  , As Discuss in call Trying to
resolving issue & performance improvement  app getting hanged on order put one validation on date 
because of emptydate api making error
  Day: 7     Date: 08/Jun/2021
  Work Description:
  Application testing and Code improvement as discuss in call , Application testing and Code improvement as
discuss in call
  Day: 8     Date: 09/Jun/2021
  Work Description:
  no electricity in morning  Testing app as discuss  Day start issue testing  Provided Agricon app for testing 
  Day: 9     Date: 10/Jun/2021
  Work Description:
  CONTACT NO AND NAME FILTER AAPELA6, PRODUCT DEMO, CUSTOMER(FARMER) ENTRY,
NEW DEALER ENTRY EMA NAME FILTER KARIYE TYARE CONTACT NUMBER NICHE AUTO
FILL THAY6 E KHOTO AAVE6 CUSTOMER FARMER => NEW FARMER => NEW FARMER
ENTRY THAYGYA PA6I FARME ENTRY KARIYA VAGAR GO BACK KARIYE TYARE seconnd
issue not getting in testing need to checkk in flow asked for video , Rewing code on after add farmer facing
issue app gets hanged  discussion with backend team
  Day: 10     Date: 11/Jun/2021
  Work Description:
  Put Condition on Add Order  if API Failure handle from android side  Provided latest agricon .apk for



testing , Add Order Return Addding Diffretn product packing  Duplicate packing  dialog comiing resolved 
Remove CR,DR Amounts From Payment Screen Android 11 permission Dialog not Coming Resolved  .apk
testing    provided agricon Latest .apk for testing   
  Day: 11     Date: 12/Jun/2021
  Work Description:
  kaushalam crm ma joidyo ne seni error6 issue Checked and Issue  From Backend Side agricon upload in
play Store  New App Copy  App Name: Mizushi India Team package name: similar app name Pm crm copy 
Both Copy Pending Need Some Resource From Backend Team Waiting For Resource , Mizushi India Team
: Bug Resolve From Backend Side  .apk Testing and  Provided For Testing  newly publish Mizushi India
Team in google play store  PMCRM App Copied Provided For Testing  Vikas CropCare  App Copied
Provided For Testing  Agrichem  App Copied Provided For Testing  Arihant Team  App Copied Provided
For Testing  after confirmation Published all above In PlayStore  
  Day: 12     Date: 14/Jun/2021
  Work Description:
  Team Of Bombay Super Team Of Vishwas Seeds Team Of Mahalaxmi Team Of NNSL Team of Sikko
make copy of above apps and provided for testing  , Team of Sikko Team Of OASiS Team Of Noble Team
Of Neoteric Team of VPL Team of Export Copy New Apps privided for testing BOMBAY OK VISHWAS
OK MAHALAXMI OK pubilsh above apps in playstore 
  Day: 13     Date: 15/Jun/2021
  Work Description:
  NNSl  Sikko  Oasis Noble Neoteric Vpl Export agro  Publish above apps on playstore    , Creeaate Copy of
Team GP  Bug Discussion on Android 11 already resolved Need app Icards task pendinng 
  Day: 14     Date: 16/Jun/2021
  Work Description:
  Making copy of GP Grace Team  Both Provided for testing , Team of GP - Grace Team - Team Of Nexus -
Redox Team - Cistronics Team - V-Spak Team - KCS Team - Create Copy Of above apps provided for
testing  After Confirmation published in play store  Facing Issue Showing Product Stock Resolved
Reuploaded  Vikas Crop Care MisuziIndiaTeam   
  Day: 15     Date: 17/Jun/2021
  Work Description:
  Making copy of  BKPL MAAXIMAA Star Pack   , Star pack Shreeji Maxeema Bkpl Test and Publish .apk
on play store
  Day: 16     Date: 18/Jun/2021
  Work Description:
  Day Start bug Rewing  getting issue in only client Device  , Report  Hide Between Dated as it was not
previously Discuss Daystart Perticular Client app getting hang Resolving  Provided Latest .apk for testing
  Day: 17     Date: 21/Jun/2021
  Work Description:
  Checking applications for frebase database  as per discussion in call with mayurbhai  , employee app Team
of Sikko Team Of OASiS Team Of Noble Team Of Neoteric Team of VPL Team of Export Agro Team of
GP Grace Team Team Of Nexus Redox Team Cistronics Team V-Spak Team Team Of Bombay Super
Hybrid Seeds Team Of Vishwas Seeds Team Of Mahalaxmi Team Of NNSL Team Of Vikas Crop Care
Nizushi Team Agricon Team Arihant Team Kaushalam CRM Agrichem CRM KCS Team BKPL Team
Team Of MaxEEma PM CRM Shreeji Enterprise Team Starpack Team Mr. Employee Tracker Team Of
Pooja Seeds   aatli dealer app6, aamathi firebase valu kem rahigyu6 joilyo OASiS Channel Partner Neoteric
Channel Partner Vishwas Seeds Business Partner NNSL Business Partner Bombay Super Family Agricon
Channel Partner MaxEEma Channel Partner Harcros Channel Partner Mr. Order Tracker Almighty Channel
Partner as discuss check firebase database availability  Discussion About  Order Return Menu in Deler App
  Day: 18     Date: 22/Jun/2021



  Work Description:
  Checking applications for frebase database  as per discussion in call with mayurbhai 
  Day: 19     Date: 25/Jun/2021
  Work Description:
  Download Document  Share Not orking Resolving  Provided.apk for testing  , check out - photo capcture
issue hang thay6 - Resolving , Checkout Issue in single client not facing issue in our device  
  Day: 20     Date: 26/Jun/2021
  Work Description:
  employee app ma visit counter tamne kya api mathi male6 jovoto Checking aand Reviewing code 
Proovided API IInformatioin  Checkout code rewing app gettiing hang on ssomoe device , Checkout Screen
code rewing app getting hang on some device  
  Day: 21     Date: 28/Jun/2021
  Work Description:
  BKPL Team app code review  waiting for call as discuss in skype , Code Rewing As Discuss in call
  Day: 22     Date: 29/Jun/2021
  Work Description:
  Code Rewing BASE Application  Removing unused code , Code Rewing BASE Application  Removing
unused code
  Day: 23     Date: 30/Jun/2021
  Work Description:
  Code Rewing BASE Application  Removing unused code
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